.

— Texas State

Technical College.-

Solicitation No:

IFB:

Date Opened:

16-PS-024

Welding Equipment

6/15/2016 at 2:30 p.m.

Airgas Midwest Orbitalium Praxair Cross Texas Supply
Vendor Name Technologies
600 Knightsbridge
201 N 23rd McAllen, PO Box 3717 Pkwy 3920 Avenue H 4009 Ben Ficklin Road
City, State, Zip Texas 78505 Sioux City IA Lincolnshire, IL Rosenberg, Texas San Angelo, Texas
Phone # 866-445-7624 1-800-831-5904 1-847-520-1147 713-681-1754 325-651-1806
roel.davila@airgas.co | Bid@midwesttechnol | Chris.Herzog@itw- robert- bjd@crosstexassupply.co
Email m ogy.com ocw.com jones@praxair.com m
HUB Status No No No No Yes
Package 1
1 |Miller XMT 450 CC/CV 907481 20 S 53,100.00 | $ 67,547.60 | No bid S 53,100.00 | $ 56,817.00
2 |Miller Dynasty 280DX Power Source 907551 20 S 73,296.00 | S 78,793.20 | No bid S 71,856.00 | $ 78,426.80
3 | Miller Dynasty RFC-14HD Foot Contractor Kit 301309 20 S 11,532.00 | $ 12,396.80 | No bid S 11,304.00 | $ 12,339.20
4 |Miller Dimension 650 cc/cv Power 907617 2 S 6,915.60 | $ 7,434.26 | No bid S 6,780.00 | $ 7,399.70
5 | Miller XMT 350VS Arc Reach Power Source 907224002 4 S 12,021.60 | $ 12,923.20 | No bid S 12,021.60 | $ 12,863.12
6 |Miller 12VS AR Feeder w/S series MIG gun (300 amp) 951589 4 S 7,152.00 | $ 7,688.40 | No bid S 7,012.80 | $ 7,652.64
Shipping 1
Discounts 1
TOTAL $ 164,017.20 | $ 186,783.46 $ 162,074.40 | $ 175,498.46
Package 2
1 |Orbitalium Power Supply Orbimat 165 0T871.000.001 1 No bid No bid S 11,872.50 | $ 15,830.00 | $ 16,938.10
2 |Orbitalium Welding Head Orbiweld 0T7827.000.002 1 No bid No bid S 7,495.00 | $ 9,995.00 | $ 10,694.65
3 |Orbitalium Clamping Shell Pair OW 76S (2 pcs) 3.00°0D 0T827.002.236 1 No bid No bid S 240.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 342.40
4 |Orbitalium Clamping Shell Pair OW 76S (2 pcs) 2.50°0D 0T827.002.226 1 No bid No bid S 240.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 321.00
5 |Orbitalium Clamping Shell Pair OW 76S (2 pcs) 2.00°0D 0T827.002.213 1 No bid No bid S 240.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 321.00
6 |Orbitalium Clamping Shell Pair OW 76S (2 pcs) 1.50°0D 0T827.002.193 1 No bid No bid S 240.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 342.40
7 |Orbitalium Clamping Shell Pair OW 76S (2 pcs) 1.00°0D 0T827.002.173 1 No bid No bid S 240.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 342.40
8 |Orbitalium Pre Ground Tungsten 10 pack OTTUNG No bid No bid S 225.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 64.20
Discount S 250.00
Shipping S 300.00
TOTAL $ 21,042.50 | $ 27,725.00 | $ 29,666.15

Package 1 awarded to: Praxair Distribution

Purchase Order:

Total Request Sent
Total Received
Total HUB Sent
Total HUB Received

AIM _AIF___BLM__ BLF ___
HIM __HIF __ASM ___ASF__WOF _1

6037148

210

115

Package 2 awarded to:
Purchase Order:

Illinois Tools Works (Orbitalium)

6037150




